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This presentation explores Japan’s role in the
age of a fraying international order. Professor
Endo will analyze the dominant trends and
issues in the contemporary world with special
focus on the dismaying performance of the
advanced democracies, the rise of authoritarian
regimes, as well as the hegemonic rivalry
between China and the United States.
Professor Endo will then turn his attention to
the implications of a frayed international order
for Japan, and consider Japan’s expected
international role in these new circumstances.
He will conclude with remarks on the potential
for Japan-U.S.-Europe cooperation.
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Ken Endo ( 遠 藤  乾 ) is Professor of
International Politics, School of Law & Dean
of the Graduate School of Public Policy,
Hokkaido University, Sapporo. He is also
Part-time Professor Global Governance
Programme, EU-ASIA Project, European
University Institute (EUI).
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